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PRESS RELEASE  
Embargo : Tuesday, January 10, 2023 – 10:00 

 
AGRI-FOOD PROCESSOR OLYMEL  

TO TEAM UP WITH CINTECH AGROALIMENTAIRE 

Saint-Hyacinthe, Quebec, Tuesday, January 10, 2023 – Olymel and Cintech 
agroalimentaire’s respective management announced today an agreement to share spaces, 
human resources and materials at Cintech’s new facilities in St-Hyacinthe. Thanks to this 
agreement, Olymel, Canada’s leading pork and poultry processor, will develop a chemistry lab 
in Cintech agroalimentaire’s new building in St-Hyacinthe. The announcement of this 
agreement also enables Cintech agroalimentaire to take a major step forward as an innovation 
driver. 

A team of professionals will be permanently installed in the new lab by the end of January, 
under the supervision of Eric Pouliot, Director, Food Science and Technology, at Olymel. This 
lab will ensure that Olymel’s research and development teams’ technology needs are properly 
met, by giving them access to a huge space within the agri-food technology park.  

Through this initiative, and as part of its activities, Cintech wishes to share equipment and 
expertise in the agri-food field. By pooling the expertise of both companies, while also 
harnessing the know-how of Olymel’s teams, Cintech aims to meet the technological needs 
and objectives that have been set to ensure the company’s development and resilience.  

“By centralizing Olymel’s chemistry lab in our new building, Cintech is taking an important step 
as an ecosystems builder. This shows that it’s possible to pool our equipment and expertise 
for the purpose of accelerating agri-food innovation in Quebec so we can, among other things, 
improve our food self-sufficiency. Resource sharing and mutual aid are an integral part of 
Cintech’s culture, and this initiative with Olymel is just the beginning of a mutually beneficial 
collaboration. This agreement also opens the door to other partnerships that will be announced 
in the coming weeks, to make it possible to pool R&D for Quebec’s agri-food companies.” 

Jean Lacroix, Chief Executive Officer, Cintech agroalimentaire. 

“This agreement enables Olymel to demonstrate its leadership in the agri-food industry, 
especially in the aspects of its activities affecting R&D and quality assurance. It’s inspired by 
an innovative approach in the R&D field that will generate a profitable synergy for our two 
organizations. We’re happy to offer our knowledge and experience in food chemistry while 
getting access to Cintech agroalimentaire’s research equipment and expertise. This innovative 
venture is a first for Canada, and we hope it leads to a new approach in pre-competitive 
research and innovation. This agreement will also allow Olymel to enjoy greater autonomy in 
the nutritional analysis of foods that the company produces, and it will provide long-term 
benefits for the entire agri-food industry in Quebec.” 
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Sylvain Fournaise, Vice President, Food Safety and Technical Services, and Research & 
Development, Olymel 

About Cintech agroalimentaire 

Since 1986, Cintech has been offering expertise and technological support to Quebec’s agri-
food businesses seeking to increase and consolidate their performance. The company’s 
mission is to increase competitiveness and foster innovation within Quebec’s agri-food 
industry by means of R&D support, consumer research and the transfer of technical 
knowledge. 

Cintech agroalimentaire has accompanied businesses in innovating, developing new products, 
improving existing products, optimizing organoleptic properties and evaluating a product’s 
appeal to consumers, among other things. Thanks to its multidisciplinary team of 50 
specialists, Cintech has accompanied countless businesses, including multinationals, in the 
achievement of hundreds of various mandates throughout the years. 

ABOUT OLYMEL 

Olymel is Canada’s leader in the production, processing and distribution of pork and poultry 
meats. The company has made feeding the world its mission, which it pursues passionately 
with products of impeccable quality. It employs over 14,000 people and has production and 
processing facilities in Quebec, Ontario, Alberta, Saskatchewan and New Brunswick. Olymel 
exports nearly a third of its total sales. Its annual sales reach $4.5 billion. The company 
markets its products mainly under the Olymel, Lafleur, Flamingo, La Fernandière, Pinty’s, Tour 
Eiffel and F. Ménard brands. 
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